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W 260 PROGRAM MONITORING & CHANGE
CFR(s): 483.440(f)(2)

At least annually, the individual program plan 
must be revised, as appropriate, repeating the 
process set forth in paragraph (c) of this section.
This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

W 260

 Based on record reviews and interviews, the 
facility failed to update the Behavior Support Plan  
(BSP) annually for 1 of 3 audit clients (#1). The 
finding is: 

Review on 2/21/23 of client #1's record revealed 
a BSP dated 11/23/21 with a target date of 1/1/23. 
Additional review of client #1's record revealed no 
updated BSP since 11/23/21. 

Interview on 2/21/23 with the facility's behavior 
specialist confirmed client #1 did not have readily 
available updated BSP. The behavior specialist 
also confirmed client #1's BSP should have been 
updated following the target date of 1/1/23.

 

W 262 PROGRAM MONITORING & CHANGE
CFR(s): 483.440(f)(3)(i)

The committee should review, approve, and 
monitor individual programs designed to manage 
inappropriate behavior and other programs that, 
in the opinion of the committee, involve risks to 
client protection and rights.
This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

W 262

 Based on record review and interview, the facility 
failed to ensure the restrictive behavior 
techniques for 1 of 3 audit clients (#1) was 
reviewed and monitored by the human rights 
committee (HRC).  The finding is:

 Review on 2/21/23 of client #1's Behavior 
Support Plan (BSP) dated 11/23/21 revealed 
target behaviors consisting of physical 
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W 262 Continued From page 1 W 262
aggression, self-injurious behavior, property 
destruction, inappropriate sexual behaviors and 
severe disruption.  Further review on 2/21/23 of 
client #1's BSP revealed no review or consent by 
the HRC.  

Interview on 2/21/23 with the facility's behavior 
specialist confirmed that based on the consent 
located in the record, client #1's BSP was not 
reviewed or consented to by the HRC.

W 263 PROGRAM MONITORING & CHANGE
CFR(s): 483.440(f)(3)(ii)

The committee should insure that these programs 
are conducted only with the written informed 
consent of the client, parents (if the client is a 
minor) or legal guardian.
This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

W 263

 Based on record review and interview, the facility 
failed to ensure restrictive programs were only 
conducted with the written informed consent of a 
legal guardian.  This affected 1 of 3 audit clients 
(#1).  The finding is:

Review on 2/21/23 of client #1's behavior support 
plan (BSP) dated 11/23/21 revealed target 
behaviors consisting of self injurious behavior, 
physical aggression, property destruction, 
inappropriate sexual behaviors and severe 
disruption.  Further review of the BSP revealed 
medications consisting of Clonidine and Mellaril.  
Continued review of the BSP revealed guardian 
consent was last obtained on 9/25/21 and must 
be renewed annually from the date of guardian's 
signature.

Interview on 2/21/23 with the qualified intellectual 
disabilities professional (QIDP) confirmed written 
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W 263 Continued From page 2 W 263
informed consent has not been obtained from the 
legal guardian since 9/25/21 and would no longer 
be valid. The QIDP confirmed that consent 
expires one year after guardian signature.

W 340 NURSING SERVICES
CFR(s): 483.460(c)(5)(i)

Nursing services must include implementing with 
other members of the interdisciplinary team, 
appropriate protective and preventive health 
measures that include, but are not limited to 
training clients and staff as needed in appropriate 
health and hygiene methods.
This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

W 340

 Based on observations, record review and 
interviews, the facility failed to ensure all staff 
were sufficiently trained in the proper wearing of 
masks. The finding is:

Upon arrival to the home on 2/21/23 at 6:15am 
staff A invited surveyor into the home. Staff A was 
not wearing a mask. At no time between 6:15am 
and when staff A clocked out at 7:15am did the 
staff wear a mask.

Interview on 2/21/23 with Qualified Intellectual 
Disabilities Professional (QIDP) revealed staff are 
required to wear a mask at all times.

Interview on 2/21/23 with the nurse revealed the 
expectation is that all vaccinated staff wear a 
mask at all times and all unvaccinated staff will 
wear double masks.

 

W 440 EVACUATION DRILLS
CFR(s): 483.470(i)(1)

at least quarterly for each shift of personnel.
This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

W 440
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W 440 Continued From page 3 W 440
 The facility failed to assure fire drills were 
conducted quarterly for each shift of personnel as 
evidenced by interview and record verification.  
The finding is:

Review on 2/21/23 of the facility's fire drill reports 
from revealed for the time period of February 
2022 through February 2023, fire drills were not 
conducted at any time on third shift.

Interview with the Qualified Intellectual Disabilities 
Professional (QIDP) revealed the home manager 
is responsible for the fire drill schedule. The QIDP 
confirmed fire drills should be conducted on all 
shifts quarterly.

 

FORM CMS-2567(02-99) Previous Versions Obsolete 15O411Event ID: Facility ID: 921991 If continuation sheet Page  4 of 4


