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W 130 PROTECTION OF CLIENTS RIGHTS
CFR(s): 483.420(a)(7)

The facility must ensure the rights of all clients.  
Therefore, the facility must ensure privacy during 
treatment and care of personal needs.
This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

W 130

 Based on observations and interviews, the facility 
failed to ensure privacy during treatment and care 
of personal needs for 1 of 6 clients (#4) relative to 
toileting. The finding is:

Observation in the group home on 10/4/22 at 6:26 
AM revealed client #4 to be using the restroom 
with the door open and staff G to be standing in 
the door way. Continued observation revealed 
staff G to remain standing in the door way and 
provide verbal toileting instructions to client #4. 
Further observation at 6:30 AM revealed staff G 
to prompt client #4 to wash their hands, however, 
no soap or hand towels were observed to be 
present.

Interview with the qualified intellectual disabilities 
professional on 10/4/22 confirmed staff should 
ensure privacy during toileting needs.

 

W 189 STAFF TRAINING PROGRAM
CFR(s): 483.430(e)(1)

The facility must provide each employee with 
initial and continuing training that enables the 
employee to  perform his or her duties effectively, 
efficiently, and competently.
This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

W 189

 Based on observations and interview, the facility 
failed to ensure staff were sufficiently trained in 
hygiene methods specific to ensuring hand soap 
and hand towels were accessible in the bathroom 
for 6 of 6 clients (#1, #2, #3, #4, #5, and #6). The 
finding is:
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W 189 Continued From page 1 W 189

Observations in the group home throughout the 
10/3-4/22 survey revealed hand soap and hand 
towels were absent in one of the homes two 
bathrooms. Continued observations throughout 
the survey revealed multiple client's to utilize the 
bathroom without hand soap or hand towels 
accessible.

Interview with staff F on 10/4/22 revealed they 
were unaware the bathroom did not have hand 
soap or hand towels. Interview with the qualified 
intellectual disabilities professional on 10/4/22 
confirmed it is staff's responsibility to ensure 
appropriate hygiene items and products are 
accessible in each bathroom.
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