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W 210 INDIVIDUAL PROGRAM PLAN
CFR(s): 483.440(c)(3)

Within 30 days after admission, the 
interdisciplinary team must perform accurate 
assessments or reassessments as needed to 
supplement the preliminary evaluation conducted 
prior to admission.

This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

W 210

 Based on record review and interview, the facility 
failed to obtain a social work assessment for 1 of 
3 audit client (#6) no later than 30 days after 
admission.  The finding is:

Review on 4/12/21 of client #6's individual 
program plan (IPP) dated 6/23/20 revealed he 
was admitted to the facility on 6/1/20.  Further 
review revealed client #6 did not have a social 
work assessment.  

During an interview on 4/13/21, the qualified 
intellectual disabilities professional (QIDP) 
confirmed client #6's social work assessment was 
not completed within 30 days of admission to the 
facility.

 

W 218 INDIVIDUAL PROGRAM PLAN
CFR(s): 483.440(c)(3)(v)

The comprehensive functional assessment must 
include sensorimotor development.

This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

W 218

 Based on record reviews and interviews, the 
facility failed to obtain a needed sensorimotor 
assessment for 1 of 3 audit clients (#6) within 30 
days of admission.  The finding is:
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W 218 Continued From page 1 W 218

Review on 4/12/21 of client #6's individual 
program plan (IPP) dated 6/23/20 revealed he 
was admitted to the facility on 6/1/20.   Further 
review revealed client #6 did not have a 
occupational therapy (OT) assessment.  

During an interview on 4/13/21, the qualified 
intellectual disabilities professional (QIDP) 
confirmed client #6's OT assessment was not 
completed within 30 days of admission to the 
facility.

W 220 INDIVIDUAL PROGRAM PLAN
CFR(s): 483.440(c)(3)(v)

The comprehensive functional assessment must 
include speech and language development.

This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

W 220

 Based on record reviews and interviews, the 
facility failed to ensure 1 of 3 audit clients (#6) 
received his initial speech/language assessments 
within 30 days of admission.  The finding is:

Review on 4/12/21 of client #6's individual 
program plan (IPP) dated 6/23/20 revealed he 
was admitted to the facility on 6/1/20.  Further 
review revealed client #6 did not have a 
speech/language assessment.

During an interview on 4/13/21, the qualified 
intellectual disabilities professional (QIDP) 
confirmed client #6's speech/language 
assessment was not completed within 30 days of 
admission to the facility.
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