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W 000 INITIAL COMMENTS W 000

 A follow-up survey survey was completed on 
2/3/2021 for survey completed 09/09/2020. All 
deficiencies cited were not corrected. New 
deficiency was cited and the facility is not in 
compliance.

 

{W 368} DRUG ADMINISTRATION
CFR(s): 483.460(k)(1)

The system for drug administration must assure 
that all drugs are administered in compliance with 
the physician's orders.

This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

{W 368}

 Based on observations, record review and 
interviews, the facility failed to ensure client #1's 
physician's orders were followed as written.  This 
affected 1 of 3 clients observed receiving 
medications.  The finding is:  

 During observations of medication administration 
on 2/3/21 at 12:45pm, client #1 ingested 
Divalproex 125mg (4) and 2 other tablets. 

Review on 2/3/21 of client #1's physician's orders 
11/22/20 revealed an order for Divalproex 125mg.  
The order noted take "3 capsules in the morning 
and 2 capsules at noon..."

During an Interview on 2/3/21 with the Staff B, the 
medication technician, confirmed client #1 should 
have taken 2 capsules at noon.

Interview on 2/3/21 with the Assistant Director of 
ICF/IID and qualified intellectual disabilities 
professional (QIDP) confirmed client #'s 
physician's orders were current and should have 
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{W 368} Continued From page 1 {W 368}

been followed.

W 382 DRUG STORAGE AND RECORDKEEPING
CFR(s): 483.460(l)(2)

The facility must keep all drugs and biologicals 
locked except when being prepared for 
administration.

This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

W 382

 Based on observations and interviews, the facility 
failed to ensure all medications remained locked.  
The finding is:

During observations in the home on 2/3/21 at 
1:02-1:07pm, Staff B and the qualified intellectual 
disabilities professional (QIDP) walked out of the 
med room leaving the surveyor in the room with 
the medication cabinet door side open.  Further 
observations revealed medications were visible to 
the surveyor.

During an interview on 2/3/21, Staff B confirmed 
she had been trained to ensure all medications 
are kept locked when not being administered. 
She added she thought the QIDP was there.

During an interview on 2/3/21, Assistant Director 
of ICF/IID and QIDP confirmed the confirmed 
staff have been trained to ensure all medications 
are kept locked when not in use.
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