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{W 000} INITIAL COMMENTS {W 000}

 A follow-up survey was conducted on 1/6/2021 
for all previous deficiencies cited on 9/29/2020.  
All deficiencies have been corrected, and a new 
noncompliance was found. The facility is still out 
of compliance.

 

W 340 NURSING SERVICES
CFR(s): 483.460(c)(5)(i)

Nursing services must include implementing with 
other members of the interdisciplinary team, 
appropriate protective and preventive health 
measures that include, but are not limited to 
training clients and staff as needed in appropriate 
health and hygiene methods.

This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

W 340

 Based on observations, record review and 
interviews, the facility failed to ensure staff were 
sufficiently trained in wearing face masks.  This 
potentially effected all the clients residing in the 
home. The finding is:

Throughout the observations in the home during 
the survey on 1/6/2021 from approximately 
9:15-10:30AM,  staff A was wearing her mask 
covering only the mouth and the nose was 
exposed. The home manager came to the home 
wearing a face shield  only.

Interview on 1/6/2021 with Staff A revealed she 
been trained to wear a mask that covers her 
mouth and the nose.

Interview on 1/6/2021 with the home manger 
revealed that staff should wear their mask to 
cover both the mouth and the nose but she was 
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allowed to wear the mask just covering the 
mouth. She further added regardless of wearing 
the face shied, the mask should be worn at all 
times.

Interview on 1/6/2021 with he facility nurse 
revealed all the staff have been trained to wear 
the mask while at work and the mask must cover 
the nose and the mouth. She further added face 
shields are optional and should not replace the 
mask.

Interview on 1/6/2021 with the program director 
(PD) indicated the staff and clients were provided 
with mask.  She added it is mandatory for the 
staff to wear the mask at work and the clients 
should be encouraged to keep the mask on. She 
further added checking temperature, completing 
screening assessment tool and routine hand 
washing and sanitizing is required. The PD 
acknowledged staff need more training to work 
effectively in reducing/preventing the spread of 
COVID-19.
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