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W 000 INITIAL COMMENTS W 000

 A complaint survey was completed on 9/15/20 for 
intakes NC00161881, NC00166866 and 
NC00166334.  One defeciency was cited as a 
result of the complaint survey.

 

W 214 INDIVIDUAL PROGRAM PLAN
CFR(s): 483.440(c)(3)(iii)

The comprehensive functional assessment must 
identify the client's specific developmental and 
behavioral management needs.

This STANDARD  is not met as evidenced by:

W 214

 Based on observations, interviews and record 
review, the facility failed to assure all adaptive 
behavior inventories (ABI) which serve as the 
comprehensive functional assessments (CFA) 
were updated to contain an accurate assessment 
of the individual's abilities.  This affected 1 of 3 
audit clients (#4).  The finding is:

 The CFA for client #4 was not updated per the 
recommendations of an internal investigation.

All clients were observed in the home on 9/15/20 
briefly at 9:45am and again from approximately 
12:30p - 1:45p.  Client #4 was seen completng all 
tasks independently (i.e. unloading the 
dishwasher and putting away dishes).

Review on 9/15/20 of an internal investigation 
conducted by the facility regarding the loss of 
personal hygiene skills, laundry skills, etc. by 
client #4  revealed a recommendation to update 
the client's CFA.

Interview with the Qualified Intellectual Disabilities 
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Any deficiency statement ending with an asterisk (*) denotes a deficiency which the institution may be excused from correcting providing it is determined that 
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Professional (QIDP) on 9/15/20 confirmed client 
#4's CFA had not been updated as of the date of 
this survey.
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